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PROJECT:
West Parish Filters Water Treatment 
Plant
1515 Granville Road
Westfield, MA 01085
Project No. 24-51

ADDENDUM NO. 14  06/13/2024

Posted: 06/13/2024 at 9:31AM EDT

Awarding Authority/Owner:
Springfield Water and Sewer Commission
250 M Street Extension
Agawam, MA 01001

Reference Contract Documents (drawings and specifications) dated 02/26/2024  

The attention of Bidders submitting proposals for the above subject project is called to the 
following addendum to the specifications and drawings.  The items set forth herein, whether of 
omission, addition, substitution, or clarifications are all to be included in and form a part of the 
proposal submitted.

 THE NUMBER OF THIS ADDENDUM (14)  MUST BE ENTERED IN THE APPROPRIATE 
SPACE “B” PROVIDED AFTER THE WORD “NUMBERS” OF THE CONTRACT FORM ENTITLED 
“FORM FOR GENERAL BID,” AND IN SPACE “B” OF THE “FORM FOR SUB-BID.”  

BID DOCUMENT MODIFICATIONS ARE AS FOLLOWS.

Other Modifications / Attachments:
The following attachment includes additional modifications, clarifications and/or provisions not included in 
the items above in this Addendum.
See document at the end of document.

All other of the portions of the Contract Documents remain unchanged.  Please be reminded to 
acknowledge this Addendum on the bid forms.

ATTACHMENTS

24-51 Addendum No. 14 No Bid FSB.pdf
--- End of Addendum No. 14  ---
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SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION 
 

WEST PARISH WATER TREATMENT PLANT 

SWSC BID NO. 24-51 
 

ADDENDUM NO. 14 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
TO ALL CONTRACTORS ESTIMATING: 
 
Bidders are hereby informed that plans and specifications for the above-mentioned 
contract are modified, corrected, and/or supplemented as follows, and that Addendum 
No. 14 becomes a part of the Contract Documents and consists of Item No. 14-1 and 
14-2. 
 
ANNOUCEMENTS (THESE ITEMS NOT TO BECOME PART OF THE CONTRACT 
DOCUMENTS AND ARE FOR INFORMATION ONLY) 

 

No bids were received for the following trade: Elevators.  
Only one (1) bid was received for the following trade: Miscellaneous & Ornamental Iron. 
This bid is restricted to itself. 



 

Page 2 of 2 

 

 
The work of the two Filed Sub-Bid Categories listed above shall be included in the work 
of the General Contractor.  
 
The results of the Pre-Qualified Filed Sub Bids are provided in Attachment A. 
 
The following Sub Bid restrictions shall apply: 

1. Misc. and Ornamental Iron: C.H. Nickerson - Restricted to C.H. Nickerson only.

2.  Painting: John Eagan CO. Inc. - bid may not be used by CTA or Vanguard. 

3. Tile: Capital Carpet and Flooring Specialists Inc.- bid may not be used by GVW, 
CJM Services, Nauset Construction, Nelco Worldwide, or Larieka Construction.  

5. Roofing and Flashing: Silktown Roofing Inc. - bid may not be used by 
Greenwood Industries. 

 
SPECIFICATION CHANGES 
 
ITEM 14-1: Section 00 20 00 – Instructions to Bidders 

 
After paragraph 14.07.N, insert the following: 
 
 O. Contractor's Certification Form (Appendix A) 

 
ITEM 14-2: Section 00 20 00 – Instructions to Bidders 
 

At the end of the section, insert the form in Attachment B. 
 
SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION  
 
Theo G. Theocles, Esq. 
Director of Legal Affairs/Chief Procurement Officer  
 
Date: June 12, 2024 
 



Attachment A – Filed Sub Bid Results
  



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form May OR May Not 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade - Acoustical Tile FSB

H. Carr & Sons, LLC Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $350,000.00 Y

The Cheviot Corporation Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $537,537.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form May OR May Not 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade -Electrical

Collins Electric., Co. Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $41,228,727.00 Y

Wayne J. Griffin Electric, Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $25,208,000.00 Y

Universal Electric Co., Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $40,999,777.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form May OR May Not 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade -Elevators 

NO BIDS

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form May OR May Not 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade -Fire Protection Spring Systems 

Carlysle Engineering Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $4,623,215.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form May OR May Not 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade - HVAC

B-G Mechanical, Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $14,946,000.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form May OR May Not 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade  - Masonry

Fernandes Masonry, Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $5,085,000.00 Y

Sullivan & Narey Construction Co. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $9,656,826.00 Y

Giliberto & Sons, LLC Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $5,748,000.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form May OR May Not 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade - Metal Windows

R&R Window Contractors, Inc. Y Y Y Y Y N Y Y $1,695,385.00 Y

Chandler Architectural Products, Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $1,540,482.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By:TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade  - Misc and Ornamental Iron

C.H. Nickerson & Co., Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $4,846,624.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 

jcantor
Text Box
CH Nickerson

jcantor_1
Snapshot



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form Alt 1

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade -Painting 

Keltic Painting LLC Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $1,077,270.00 Y $424,000.00

John W. Egan Co. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $598,440.00 Y $196,800.00 

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 

jcantor_2
Text Box
CTA, Vanguard

jcantor_3
Snapshot



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form May OR May Not 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade -Plumbing

B-G Mechanical Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $6,776,000.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade - Roofing and Flashing  

Titan Roofing, Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $5,358,000.00 Y

Silktown Roofing, Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $3,883,000.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 

jcantor_4
Text Box
Greenwood Industries

jcantor_5
Snapshot



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade -Tile

Capital Carpet & Flooring Specialists, 

Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $627,397.00 Y

Ayotte & King For Tile, Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $429,000.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 

jcantor_6
Text Box
GVW, CJM Services, Nauset Construction, Nelco Worldwide, Larieka Construction 

jcantor_7
Snapshot



BIDDER Prequalified Contractor's Tax Equal Forms SWSC DCAMM DCAMM Bid Price Signed Bid Form May OR May Not 

Yes/No Bid Bond Cert. Opp Statement for FSB

Corporate 

Cert Eligibility Form Update Statement be used with:

Trade - Waterproofing, Damp-

proofing and Caulking 

Superior Caulking & Waterproofing 

Co., Inc. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $2,075,000.00 Y

The Waterproofing Company LLC Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $1,233,800.00 Y

Giliberto & Sons, LLC. Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $2,058,000.00 Y

Witness: STOpened By: TGT

SPRINGFIELD WATER AND SEWER COMMISSION

Invitation For Bid 

WPFWTP Project SUBS- 

SWSC Bid No. 24-51

Opened On: 06/11/24 at 2:00 p.m. 



Attachment B – Contractor's Certification Form
  



THE COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHUSETTS  

 

SUPPLEMENTAL EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY, NON-DISCRIMINATION 

AND AFFIRMATIVE ACTION PROGRAM 

 

 

CONTRACTOR’S CERTIFICATION 

 

 

______________________________________________________________certifies that they: 

 (Contractor Name) 

 

1. Will not discriminate in their employment practices; 

 

2. Intend to use the following listed construction trades in the work under the contract  

 

    __________________________________________________________________________ 

 

 _______________________________________________________________________; and 

 

3. Will make good faith efforts to comply with the minority employee and women employee 

workforce participation ratio goals and specific affirmative action steps contained herein; 

and 

 

4. Are in compliance with all applicable federal and state laws, rules, and regulations governing 

fair labor and employment practices; and 

 

5. Will provide the provisions of the “Supplemental Equal Employment Opportunity, Non-

Discrimination and Affirmative Action Program” to each and every subcontractor employed 

on the Project and will incorporate the terms of this Section into all subcontracts and work 

orders entered into on the Project.   

 

6. Agree to comply with all provisions contained herein. 

 

 

 ___________________________________________________________________________ 

   (Signature of authorized representative of Contractor)    Date 

 

  

      ___________________________________________________________________________ 

   (Printed name of authorized representative of Contractor) 

 



XI. Subcontractor Requirements 

 

 Prior to the award of any subcontract for a state construction contract or a state assisted 

construction contract, regardless of tier, the Prime or General Contractor shall provide  all 

prospective subcontractors with a complete copy of this Section entitled  “Supplemental Equal 

Employment Opportunity, Non-Discrimination and Affirmative Action Program” and will 

incorporate the provisions of this Section by reference into any and all contracts or work orders 

for all subcontractors providing work on the Project.  In order to ensure that the said 

subcontractor's certification becomes a part of all subcontracts under the prime contract, the 

Prime or General Contractor shall certify in writing to the administering agency that it has 

complied with the requirements as set forth in the proceeding paragraph. 
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