TOWN OF SOUTHBURY, CONNECTICUT

ADDENDUM NO. 1
REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE NO. 130-009 OLD FIELD ROAD
OVER BULLET HILL BROOK

Bid Opening: Friday March 21. 2025
@ 10:00 AM

All bidders are hereby advised of the following amendments to the Contract Bid Documents which are
hereby an integral part of the specifications for the subject project, prepared by Cardinal Engineering
Associates, Inc., Meriden, Connecticut, to the same extent as all other documents.

Bids submitted shall be deemed to include the Contract Documents information as shown in this
Addendum. General bidders shall notify sub-bidders that may be affected by this Addendum as applicable.
Failure by the Bidder to incorporate this Addendum may result in a rejection of the bid. Bidders are directed
to review changes to all portions of the work as changes to one portion may affect the work of another.

I

PROJECT MANUAL

a.

INFORMATION TO BIDDERS - Item 23 TIME FOR COMMENCEMENT AND
COMPLETION AND LIQUIDATED DMAGE - first paragraph change 150 consecutive
calendar days to 120.

BID SHEETS — revised bid Sheets attached.

SPECIAL PROVISION Page 73 - CONTRACT TIME AND LIQUIDATED DAMAGES -
change One Hundred and Fifty (150) calendar days to 120.

SECTION 1.05.02-1 - CONTROL OF WORK - All correspondence and submittals to the
Town of Southbury are to be directed to Blake Leonard, Director of Public Works in lieu of Jeff
Manville.

SECTION 1.08 PROSECUTION AND PROGRESS - sixth paragraph change 180 calendar
days to 120.

ITEM #0201001A — CLEARING AND GRUBBING - Due to time limitations dictated by the
various environmental permits the Town of Southbury will take down all trees within the
project limits. The ITEM #0201001A — CLEARING AND GRUBBING will include grubbing
stumps only. All other items will remain in effect. The Lump Sum Price for this item shall
reflect this change.

Appendix A — Wage rates This project is prevailing wage — rates from State are pending.
APPPENDIX B - Permits

a. Town of Southbury Inland wetland and Watercourse permit was approved March 11,
2025 — approved plans attached.

b. ACOE 404 and CTDEEP 401 WQC pending.
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II. PROJECT PLANS

a. THE FOLLOWING PLANS SHEETS HAVE BEEN REVISED AND ARE TO BE REPLACED IN THE
PLANS SET - ATTACHED:

GEN-01 A1
PLA-01 Al
Xsc-1 Al
XSC-2 Al
vSc-3 Al
XsCc-4 Al
XSC-5 Al
XSC-6 Al
STR-01 A1
STR-02 A1
STR-04 A1
STR-10 A1
WTH-01 Al

III. NOTES FROM PRE-BID MEETING - ATTACHED.

THE BIDDER MUST ACKNOWLEDGE THAT THE BID INCLUDES THIS
ADDENDUM AT THE BOTTOM OF SCHEDULE OF PRICES
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TOWN OF SOUTHBURY, CONNECTICUT
REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE NO. 130-009
OLD FIELD ROAD OVER BULLET HILL BROOK

Meeting Minutes

Purpose: Non-Mandatory Pre-bid Meeting
Date: 3/13/25

Time: 9:00 am

Place: Job site

1. INTRODUCTION
o lin attendance
o Owner: Town of Southbury - Matt Tarnowski, Project Administrator
Tom Farrelly — Road Foremen
o Design Team — Gary Giroux, Cardinal Engineering
o Contractors in attendance:
= Black & Warner
= Dayton Construction
= Nagy Brothers
= New England Infrastructure
o Plan Holders — Attached

2. SITEVISIT
o Familiarization with the Project location — contractors present walked the site.

3. STANDARDS - standards for bidding were stressed.

Standard Specifications Form 819

Special Provisions in Project Manual

Item 9 — Unit Prices of Information to Bidders.

Item 14 — Award of Contract; Rejection of Bids of information to Bidder. Hold Bids for 90 days.
Item 21 — Set Aside Requirements -Minimums established.

Item 23 - Completion and liquidated Damages. 120 Calendar Days allotted / Liquidated
damages - $1,200 / day.

O O O O O O

4. ACCESS
o Restricted to Temporary Easements
o Old Field Road is closed.

4. MAJOR ELEMENTS

o Time of year restrictions are in effect.

o Utilities
e Overhead wires stay as is.
e Eversource Gas — to be placed under the culvert.
o CT Water — to be place under the culvert.

o Clearing and Grubbing — Trees to be removed by the Town prior to construction due to timing

of start and restriction of April 15" for removal by environmental permit (Bats).

5. Bidder Questions: Submitted questions including those asked at the site:

1. QBox Culverts - United is stating they are out to November for delivery. Also United requests a
letter to say shorter (lighter) box culverts are acceptable to use because of the overhead wire
limitations. There will have to be a redesign for that.

A There are other fabricators available - check with them for scheduling. Time for completion will
remain at 120days however the start date will be discussed and set based on the fabricators
schedule. Shorter lighter boxes are acceptable. See special provision regarding design and load
rating.



2. Q Borrow fill line item needed for large area of wash out
A ltem 0207000- Borrow and quantity has been added to the Bid Sheets — attached.

3. Q Parapet line item needed #0601121 using 4462 concrete
A Item 0601121A — Headwall Concrete covers this — see Concrete Components Table on Sheet #
STR-01.

4. Q Confirm Office trailer is omitted.
A Office Trailer is omitted see revised Bid Sheets — attached.

5. Q Confirm water and gas lines are presently dead.
A Water and gas lines_are dead.

6. Q Detour sign plan? Probably not needed.
A Detour signs are not needed and removed from bid sheet — attached.

7. Q Invasive species? Probably not needed.
A May be present and must be removed per specification.

8. Q Please confirm state funded portion is 50% for CHRO
A The project is funded under the State local Bridge Program — funding is 50% of bid price.

9. Q Is storm manhole at station 4+31 new or used?
A Storm manhole is new — see revised bid sheets — attached.

10. Q There is no line item for 36-inch Flared End Section.
A ltem # 0686700.36 - 36” Reinforced Concrete Drainage Pipe End added — see revised bid
sheets — attached.

11. Q There is no line item for 18-inch Flared End Section.
A ltem # 0686700.18 - 18” Reinforced Concrete Drainage Pipe End — see revised bid sheets —
attached.

12. Q Working with private utilities
A See number 7 below/.

13. Q #0601062 Footing Concrete / item qty 93 cy / we calculate 81 cy
A Quantity changed to xx cy — see revised bid sheet - attached.

14. Q #0601064 Abutment and Wall Concrete / item qty 86 cy / we calculate 68 cy
A Quantity changed to xx cy — see revised bid sheet — attached.

15. Q How is Concrete for Headwall (7 cy) paid for?
A ltem # 0601121A — Headwall Concrete. See item 3 above.

16. Q How is Concrete sidewalk (3 cy) over the box Culvert paid?
A ltem # 0921001 Concrete Sidewalk added— see revised bid sheets — attached. See detail on
revised sheet STR-10 A1.
17. Q Culvert to headwall connection (mechanical dowel splicer). Drawing STR-07 shows #5@ 6” o/
c. Drawing STR-09 shows #4@ 5 o/c. Which is correct?
A Detail on STR-07 is correct.
6. Other items discussed:

1. Sidewalk will be cast with integral curb — detail attached.



N

oakw

Concrete barriers on site are the property of the Town of Southbury. Concrete barriers called for
in the contract documents are to be provided by the contractor.

Detour signs have been removed from the project — see attached bid sheets.

Temporary Bypass Pipe can be any type of pipe sized accordingly.

Sprinkler system replacement is not in the project.

Possible use of Library parking lot for laydown / storage are depending on timing of the project.
Note library which is presently closed is scheduled to be opened sometime this fall. Check with
Town for restrictions.

Eversource inquired:

It seems the Town wants the gas main installed under the proposed culvert. A couple of
questions regarding construction sequencing with answers in bold:

o Would the Town’s contractor excavate up to culvert depth and have the gas contractor
install the pipe? Yes

e During what stage of the culvert reconstruction will the gas main relocation happen? As
soon as the contractor gets the excavation to bottom of the Compacted Granular
Fill.

o Will the Town’s contractor allow Eversource gas to work within their excavation support
system? The contractor will provide for this.

In this regard, the contractor will allow time in his work for this to happen. Cost for this time will
be included in the item Mobilization and Project Closeout.

CTWater will be accommodated in the same manor.
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REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE No. 130-009 OLD FIELD ROAD BRIDGE
OVER BULLET HILL BROOK

Plan Holders

Date

2/25/25 8:31 am

3/7/25 7:46 am

2/25/25 7:54 am

2/27/25 9:17 am

2/24/25 3:24 pm

3/11/25 9:46 am

2/27/25 11:40 am

3/4/25 9:30 am

3/6/25 11:14 am

3/7/25 8:49 am

Company

Black & Warner Construction Co.,Inc.

364 New Britain Avenue
PO Box 121
Unionville, CT 06085

ConstructConnect
3825 Edwards Road
Suite 800

Cincinnati, OH 45209

Dayton Construction Company Inc.
146 Bunker Hill Rd
Watertown, CT 06795

Grasso COMPANIES
485 Pepper Street
Monroe, CT 06468

Guerrera Construction
154 Christian Street
oxford, CT 06478

Lawrence Brunoli Inc.
11 Eastview Dr
Farmington, CT 06032

Loureiro Contractors, Inc.
100 Northwest Drive
Plainville, CT 06062

McNamee Construction Corp.
154 Route 202
Lincolndale, NY 10540

Nagy Bros. Const. LLC
550 Main St.
Monroe, CT 06468

New England Infrastructure, Inc.
16 Brent Drive
Hudson, MA 01749

Contact

Eugene Warner Jr.
Tel: 860-673-5621

Courtney Huesman
Tel: 5134588690

Matthew Dayton
Tel: 8602742998

Chris Musculino
Tel: 2038380123

Joseph Guerrera
Tel: 203-888-5069

Daniel Neagle
Tel: 8606769900

Debbie Brown
Tel: 413-530-9017

Shirley Ferreira
Tel: 914-243-5910

Norman Nagy
Tel: 203-268-0454

Prakhar (Prak) Saxena
Tel: 978-293-3535



Date

2/25/25 11:33 am

3/6/25 8:49 am

2/25/25 8:08 am

3/17/25 7:52 am

2/27/25 1:01 pm

Company

njr construction llc
288 South Main Street
Thomaston, CT 06790

Northern Construction Service, LLC
1520 Park Street, PO Box 900
Palmer, MA 01069

Stone Construction Co., Inc.
168 Main St. South
SOUTHBURY, CT 06488

TradeMark Contractors LLC
175 Lake Avenue
Bristol, CT 06010

Xenelis Construction Co., Inc
30 Old Indian Trail
Middlefield, CT 06455

Contact
nicholas m mancini jr

Tel: 8606187322

Dulce Montana
Tel: 4132891230

George Stone
Tel: 203-264-6501

Gino Troiano, Jr.
Tel: 860-582-3006

John MclLaughlin
Tel: 8603475823



BID PROPOSAL
REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE NO. 130-009

OLD FIELD ROAD OVER BULLET HILL BROOK
SOUTHBURY, CONNECTICUT

ITEM No

Brief Description: Unit or Lump Sum
Bid (in both words and figures)

Est
Quantity

Ext. Total
in Figures

1| 0201001

A

CLEARING AND GRUBBING
THE LUMP SUM PRICE OF
$

DOLLARS AND CENTS
¢ )

LS

2| 0202000

EARTH EXCAVATION
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND CENTS
& )

990

3| 0207000

BORROW
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND CENTS
& )

1020

4| 0202216

EXCAVATION AND REUSE OF EXISTING CHANNEL BOTTOM MATERIAL
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND CENTS
¢ )

130

5| 0202219

SUPPLEMENTAL STREAMBED CHANNEL MATERIAL
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND CENTS
& )

6 | 0202529

CUT BITUMINOUS CONCRETE PAVEMENT
THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF
N

DOLLARS AND CENTS
¢ )

75

7| 0203202

STRUCTURE EXCAVATION-EARTH (EXCLUDING COFFERDAM AND DEWATERING)
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ )

900

8 | 0203304

STRUCTURE EXCAVATION-ROCK (EXCLUDING COFFERDAM AND DEWATERING)
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF
N

DOLLARS AND CENTS
¢ )

60

9 | 0204001

COFFERDAM AND DEWATERING
THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF
$

DOLLARS AND CENTS
& )

280

10| 0204151

HANDLING WATER
THE LUMP SUM PRICE OF
S

DOLLARS AND CENTS
¢ )

LS

11 0209001

FORMATION OF SUBGRADE
THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND CENTS
¢ )

960




BID PROPOSAL
REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE NO. 130-009

OLD FIELD ROAD OVER BULLET HILL BROOK
SOUTHBURY, CONNECTICUT

Brief Description: Unit or Lump Sum Est Ext. Total
ITEM No Bid (in both words and figures) Quantity in Figures

121 0210303 | A TURBIDITY CONTROL CURTAINS

THE LUMP SUM PRICE OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

(& ) LS
131 0212000 = A SUBBASE

THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 300
14| 0214100 | A COMPACTED GRANULAR FILL

THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 100
151 0216000 PERVIOUS STRUCTURE BACKFILL

THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF

S

DOLLARS AND CENTS

S ) 690
16 0219001 SEDIMENTATION CONTROL SYSTEM

THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 720
17| 0304002 | A PROCESSED AGGREGATE BASE

THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 130
18 0406171 | A HMA S0.5

THE PRICE PER TON OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 110
191 0406172 | A HMA S0.375

THE PRICE PER TON OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 110
20 0406173 | A HMA S0.25

THE PRICE PER TON OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 5
21| 0406303 | A SAWING AND SEALING JOINTS

THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 60
22 0503866 | A REMOVAL OF EXISTING CULVERT

THE LUMP SUM PRICE OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) LS




BID PROPOSAL

REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE NO. 130-009

OLD FIELD ROAD OVER BULLET HILL BROOK
SOUTHBURY, CONNECTICUT

Brief Description: Unit or Lump Sum Est Ext. Total
ITEM No Bid (in both words and figures) Quantity in Figures

2.

3%

0586001.10 TYPE 'C' CATCH BASIN - 0'-10' DEEP
THE PRICE PER EACH OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ ) 1 $

2

=

0586040.10 TYPE 'C-L' CATCH BASIN - 0'-10' DEEP
THE PRICE PER EACH OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ ) 2 $

2

9

0586500.10 MANHOLE - 0-10' DEEP

THE PRICE PER EACH OF
N
DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ ) 1 $

26| 0601062 | A [FOOTING CONCRETE
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
& ) 81 $

27| 0601064 | A |ABUTMENT AND WALL CONCRETE
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ ) 69 $

28| 0601088 | A |[CONCRETE FORM LINERS
THE PRICE PER SQUARE FOOT OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
s ) 808 $

29| 0601121 | A [HEADWALL CONCRETE
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
(& ) 7 $

30| 0601125 | A 20'X 9' PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT
THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ ) 35 $

31| 0601502 1/2" PREFORMED EXPANSION JOINT FILLER FOR BRIDGES
THE PRICE PER SQUARE FOOT OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
6 ) 150 $

32] 0602030 DEFORMED STEEL BARS - GALVANIZED
THE PRICE PER POUND OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ ) 15000 $

33| 0652011 18" R.C. CULVERT END

THE PRICE PER EACH OF
$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ ) 1 $




BID PROPOSAL

REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE NO. 130-009

OLD FIELD ROAD OVER BULLET HILL BROOK
SOUTHBURY, CONNECTICUT

Brief Description: Unit or Lump Sum Est Ext. Total
ITEM No Bid (in both words and figures) Quantity in Figures
34| 0652015 36" R.C. CULVERT END
THE PRICE PER EACH OF
$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ ) 1 $

3

[y

0686000.18 18" R.C. PIPE - 0'-10' DEEP
THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF

$
DOLLARS AND CENTS
6 ) 85 $

360686000.36 36" R.C. PIPE - 0'-10' DEEP
THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

(s ) 113 $
37] 0703011 INTERMEDIATE RIPRAP

THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 60 $
38] 0703031 | a |ROCK WEIR

THE PRICE PER EACH OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

s ) 8 $

391 0707009 | A MEMBRANE WATERPROOFING (COLD LIQUID ELASTOMERIC)
THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 86 $
40| 0708001 DAMPPROOFING

THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

(s ) 200 $
41] 0755009 GEOTEXTILE

THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

(s ) 330 $

42| 0819002 | A [PENETRATING SEALER PROTECTIVE COMPOUND
THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF

$

DOLLARS AND CENTS

& ) 30 $
43| 0822001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC BARRIER

THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF

S

DOLLARS AND CENTS

$ ) 40 $

44| 0904990 | A [METAL BRIDGE RAIL

THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF
N
DOLLARS AND CENTS
$ ) 44 $




BID PROPOSAL

REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE NO. 130-009
OLD FIELD ROAD OVER BULLET HILL BROOK
SOUTHBURY, CONNECTICUT

ITEM No

Brief Description: Unit or Lump Sum
Bid (in both words and figures)

Est
Quantity

Ext. Total
in Figures

45

0921001

CONCRETE SIDEWALK
THE PRICE PER SQUARE FOOT OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

1449

46

0922501

BITUMINOUS CONCRETE DRIVEWAY
THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND

&

CENTS

38

47

0922503

GRAVEL DRIVEWAY
THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

24

48

0944000

FURNISHING AND PLACING TOPSOIL
THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

1150

49

0950005

TURF ESTABLISHMENT
THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

1150

50

0952051

CONTROL AND REMOVAL OF INVASIVE VEGETATION
THE PRICE PER SQUARE YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

288

51

0970006

TRAFFIC PERSON (MUNICIPAL POLICE OFFICER)
THE ESTIMATED PRICE OF
$ SIX THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED

DOLLARS AND NO

($ 6,300.00

CENTS

EST

6,300.00

52

0971001

MAINTENANCE AND PROTECTION OF TRAFFIC
THE LUMP SUM PRICE OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

LS

53

0974001

REMOVAL OF EXISTING MASONRY
THE PRICE PER CUBIC YARD OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

21

54

0975004

MOBILIZATION AND PROJECT CLOSEOUT
THE LUMP SUM PRICE OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

LS

55

0976002

BARRICADE WARNING LIGHTS-HIGH INTENSITY
THE PRICE PER DAY OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

1200




BID PROPOSAL

REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGE NO. 130-009

OLD FIELD ROAD OVER BULLET HILL BROOK
SOUTHBURY, CONNECTICUT

Brief Description: Unit or Lump Sum
ITEM No Bid (in both words and figures)

Est
Quantity

Ext. Total
in Figures

56| 0978002 TRAFFIC DRUM
THE PRICE PER EACH OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

57| 0979003 CONSTRUCTION BARRICADE - TYPE III
THE PRICE PER EACH OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

58| 0980020 CONSTRUCTION SURVEYING
THE LUMP SUM PRICE OF
N

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

LS

59| 0981100 42" TRAFFIC CONE
THE PRICE PER EACH OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

60| 1204210 | A [FURNISH AND INSTALL PROJECT SIGN
THE PRICE PER EACH OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

61| 1209007 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKING 4" YELLOW
THE PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT OF
$

DOLLARS AND

$

CENTS

300

62| 1700005 | A |TESTING
THE ESTIMATED COST OF
$ SEVEN THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED

DOLLARS AND NO

($ 7.500.00

CENTS

EST

7,500.00

TOTAL BID:

DOLLARS

AND

CENTS

SUBMITTED BY:

(PRINTED NAME)

(TITLE)

(SIGNATURE)

(DATE)
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NOTES: 1) THIS DETAIL IS TO BE USED WHERE "SAWCUT & MATCH EXISTING PAVEMENT" IS CALLED THIS DETAIL IS TO BE USED WHERE "SAWCUT & MATCH EXISTING PAVEMENT" IS CALLED FOR ON THE PLANS. 2) OVERLAP BOTH BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COURSES OVER EXISTING SUBBASE. OVERLAP BOTH BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COURSES OVER EXISTING SUBBASE. 3) MINIMUM THICKNESS TO BE SAME AS PROPOSED BITUMINOUS OR MATCH THICKNESS OF MINIMUM THICKNESS TO BE SAME AS PROPOSED BITUMINOUS OR MATCH THICKNESS OF EXISTING PAVEMENT, WHICHEVER IS GREATER. 4) PAVEMENT MATCH TREATMENT WILL BE INCIDENTAL TO THE WORK. PAVEMENT MATCH TREATMENT WILL BE INCIDENTAL TO THE WORK. 5) TO BE PAID FOR UNDER THE ITEM "CUT BITUMINOUS CONCRETE PAVEMENT".TO BE PAID FOR UNDER THE ITEM "CUT BITUMINOUS CONCRETE PAVEMENT".
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